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The mission of the Office of Fraternity & Sorority Life (FSL) at the 
University of Nebraska at Kearney is to advance the fraternity and 
sorority life experience at UNK through education and advisement. 
The office is committed to providing opportunities for personal and 
professional development, community engagement, and cultivation of 
co-curricular experiences that enhances a student-centered learning 
environment.

At UNK, our Fraternity and Sorority Life community is comprised of 
12 chapters (six fraternities and six sororities) with over 500 students 
involved. Members of Greek organizations are encouraged to emphasize 
our values. Each of our organizations have their own rituals, traditions, 
and areas of focus, but all strive to live by the four core values of 
scholarship, leadership, service, and friendship.

• Scholarship: Helping students reach their academic goals and 
graduating with a college degree.

• Leadership: Extend additional opportunities for the development of 
critical transferable leadership and life skills, like critical thinking, 
working across difference, prioritization, time management, effective 
communication, event planning, and organization.

• Service: Giving back to others locally and globally through time, 
talent, and treasure.

• Friendship: Create connections, network, elevate community, and 
foster a sense of belonging for all who participate in Fraternity and 
Sorority Life.

We work to establish and foster positive relations with administration, 
faculty, and Greek and non-Greek student organizations. Through these 
endeavors, the Office of Fraternity & Sorority Life strives to complement 
the mission of the Division of Student Affairs and the mission of the 
University of Nebraska at Kearney.

To learn more about our community, the organizations it's comprised of, 
and how to join please visit unk.edu/fsl (https://www.unk.edu/offices/
student_life/greek_affairs/).
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